RESOLUTION NO. 2193

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF KIRKLAND
AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO SIGN ON BEHALF OF THE CITY OF
KIRKLAND A CONTRACT FOR GARBAGE COLLECTION AND DISPOSAL
BETWEEN THE CITY OF KIRKLAND AND BAYSIDE WASTE HAULING
AND TRANSFER COMPANY, INC.

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of
Kirkland as follows:

WHEREAS, the City of Kirkland operates under the authority
of Ordinance No. 2038 its own garbage collection utility, and

WHEREAS, it has been determined by the City of Kirkland
that the collectlon and disposal of garbage and refuse within
the City of Kirkland can best be done by contract.between the
City and a private contractor, and the City having heretofore
called for bids for the collection and disposal of garbage,
refuse and swill and work incidental thereto, and Bayside
Waste Hauling and Transfer Company, Inc., having become the
successful bidder,

NOW, THEREFORE,

Section 1. The Mayor is hereby authorized and directed
to sign on behalf of the City of Kirkland that certain contract
between the City of Kirkland and Bayside Waste Hauling and
Transfer Company, Inc., for the complete collection of garbage
and refuse within the City of Kirkland in accordance with the
terms thereof, for the period commencing July 1, 1973 and
ending June 30, 1978, copy of which contract is attached to
the original of this resolution and by this reference incor-
porated herein as though fully set forth.

ADOPTED by majority vote of the Kirkland City Council

in regular meeting on the 18th day of June s 1973,
ayor

“_/ o
Direéctor of/AdminisStration and Finance

(ex officié City Clerk)




¥"Contra¢tor“

" CONTRACT

THIS AGREEHENT mnade and enterad into this Jﬁxh day of
June e 1973 by and bctwocn the City of Kirkland,l'

e

wiawﬂonvchnrto#'Cédaidity,-heroinaftet~oalled "City", lnd Bayside

. Waste Hauling and Trannfnr Company, Ine.. horcinaftov callad

é

NITNLSSETH:
wHEREAS, thd City of Kirkland operates under the: nuthority

. of Ovdinance No. 2038 its own‘gnrbage colloction utility, and

wHBRLAS it has boon datermincd by the City of Kivkland _

'that the collcction and disposal of garbage and refuan within

"the City of Kirkland aan~boat bc done by contract betwcen the

City and a pvivaxc contractor, ‘and the City having herctofore .
callod for bide fov the collection and diaposal of garbage,

refuse and swill 4and work inaidental thereto. and the" contractor

«havinx become the .ucccnaful biddcr.

- NOW, THEREFORL it is herqby agrcnd and covenanted by and
btheen the parties as followe | R

1. Contvact Documenta. Thc torms. conditionc and

covannnts of the oontract are set tovth in tha following docu- '

. mcntl, all of which are component parts of said contract and

as fully a part thcvnof as if herein uat out in full .and if

not lttndhod, as i! ‘hereto attached:




(a) This agrecqut 
_(ﬁ)v Invitatidn for bids
. (e) 'inifructiona'to bidders

L (d),’Special spcoificgtiéna for gdrﬁdgg'gndA_*'

refuse collcotion

(e) Addendum 1 to npacial apccificationa far -
garbage and rafu;. doilection "
' BNEI N Amcndod proposal aubmitted by oontructor
) Lotter dated _ June 28, 1973° ' grom’

‘contractor re aplvtmcnt rates

(h) Ordinancc No. 2038 of th‘ City of Kirkland as

‘heretofore. amondad, and furthor as now or heteaftcr ‘may be

‘;famcndod during thc litc of this coatract, providcd that auoh

futurc amcndment uay modify the mannar and mcthcd of work to

be performed by the oonxrpgtor, nut shall not reduce or: othon-, RN

wisc opcrate ta amend ‘the basis for uOnsidtration to bc paid
hcvoundcr al st forth in the propoaal -ubuitted by the .
contractor, uithout the writtan consent of the contractor.

2, zcrm. Thd contract shall oommehc. on July 1, 1973,

:Qnd end on Juno 30, 1978, Durlng said tcrﬂ oontraotor asroca

to oollect and remove all vcfuce, garbasc,wrubbigh, ashes and

" swill frqb all builginga,vstructurcs, plaoga of bpginqis; plants,

dwellipg;,‘ntoras,'office bﬁi;dinge,3f1r¢fh6uoes{;sbhéclh;

hofql,,_ﬂun;QLpal'buildings, theaters, garages, publié”mnvkotq,‘




j/,

restaurants and other places of aécumuintion;'ail in accor-
dance with the contract ddcuménts; and. dontbactob'ahall make -
a completo and thorough collection and dispasal thereof.

3. Conlideration t0 ba paid For the full and faithful

| pcrformnnce of the services required to be performcd by the

contractor purauant to this agreoncnt. contraotor lhall be .

',compcnsat;d in accordanca with the schedule of compensation

set forth in Alternate III, subsections 1(a), 2 and 3 of the

amended propboal submitted by contractor. Unless otherwise

hgv@cd dpon in writing, payments shall be made to the contractor

mbnthly for ndryicél rendered in the prior month;'and all

 charges and peﬁaltiop'aslalidd‘fbr said ﬁridr,month; pursuant

to the provisions of the contract documents, shall be deducted

 from such monthly payment. The customer count ahull_bc”bascd

upon the record cf'aativi custom@ra maihtainedAby thé'city._
Thc count may ba adjuutod to rcflcct changou in active cus-
tomcra every thiss momthe. ' '

u. Mandatery oollaction. Gérbage'ﬁnd reruno‘cbilcctionv

-hall be nandatory in all aroae of the uity snrvcd by the con-

ftraotor oxcept as to tho-- persons obtaining a private pcrmit

as referred to in Sgction 18 of tho special 'pecifications.

5, Colloétioﬁ‘ichcﬁuleq. 'Contvactdﬁlshall’usg his

best efforts at all times to keep all persons :rdm whom he is

collcéting”ghpbaga and rcfupciqdviscd of his schedule for

‘collection, both date and time of pickup, and_dhali,fﬂrthev




»

‘exert his best efforts to‘mgint§1n,gotua1 collection in

aecordancc with said uchcdulo.'~“~'

| IN WITNESS WHBREOF. the parties heveto have cxecutod

thia agrnemcnt tht day and yoar first writton aboVe.
crry oF KIR_LAND |

Attest:

BITector of Adminfotrat:lan L3 TTREnGE
(ex officio City Clerk)




CALL FOR BIDS
CITY OF KIRKLAND

Call for Bids: For the collection and disposal of garbage and refuse for the |
City of Kirkland as authorized by Ordinance Number 2038 for a pericd of five
. {5) years commencing July 1, 1973.

- Notice is hereby given that the City of Kirkland will receive
sealed bids in the office of the City Clerk, City Hall, 210 Main Street,
Kirkland, Washington up to the hour of 2:00 PM on Friday, May 25, 1973.
At this time bids will be opened and pubiicly read aloud for: the collection
and disposal of garbage and refuse for the City of Kirkland as authorized _
by Ordinance Number 2038 for a perfod of Five (5) years commensing July 1, 1973,

Each bid shall be accompanied by & bid propesal deposit in the
form of a certified or cashier’s check payable to the City of Kirkiand, ov
a bid bond issued by a surety company 1icensed to do business within the
State of Washington for a sum of not less that $25,000.00 and no bids shall
be considered unless accompanied by such bid proposal deposit.

‘ No bid pvopbsal will be accepted from any person or fivm who has
. not attended the pre=bid conference to be held by the City of Kirkland on
Monday, May 14, 1973. Attendance at sald conference {s wmanditory.

The City Council of the City of Kirkland will award the bid at their
regular Council meeting on Monday, June 4, 1973. The City Council also
veserves the right to reject any and all bids, to wailve any informality in _
the bidding, and to make the award as deemed to the best interest of the City.

Specificétionsb.ébnd?tiomsg and manner of bidding, may be obtained
from the office of the Dircctor of Administration and Finance.

Tom J. Andersosm = . 4 B
Director of R?ginistr tion and Finance

o —
- .
g E

- First Publication: April 25, 1973
Last Publication: May 2, 1973



City of Kirkland, King County
Washington

Ingtruetion to Bidders and Proposed Specifications
for Collection and Disposal of Garbage and Raefuse
in the City of Kirvkland as authorized by Ordinance
No. 2038, and Proposed Bid Form

I. Instruction to Bidders

Ssetion 1: Bids will ba computed and presented on the printed
forms provided without amendment, and Bidder must submit a
bid on each item within each alternative, or their bid will
got be considered. The proposal shall be typed or written in
nk.

Section 2: Bidders shall make proposals on the basis of fur-
nishing equipment and carrying on the collections set forth in
the specifications attached hereto. ALl bids shall be accom-
panied by a bid proposal deposit, either in the form of a
certified or cashier’s check payable to the City of Kirkland,
or a bid bond issued by & surety company licensed te do business
within the State of Washington, said bid proposal deposit to bs
in the amount of $25,000.00, and no bid gshall be considered
unless accompanied theveby. Upon acceptance of one bidder

or rejection of all bids, the bid proposal daposits of

the unsuccessful bidders will be returned. The bid proposal
deposit of the suceessful bidder will be held until a contraect
ie entered into. IXf the successful bidder fails to enter into
such contract in accordanee with his bid within 10 days of the
date of notification that he is the successful bidder, said
daposit ghall be forfeited to the City.

Bafore such contract between the suceessful bidder shall
be valid or binding, the contrasctor shall provide & performance
bond to the City of Kirkland as provided in the specifications
attached hexreto,

Saction 3: The area to be served shall be the entire area
within the city limits of the City of Kirkland as it now exnists,
or ig subsequently expanded by annexation or consolidation (less
those territories eoversd by separate franchise or permits pur-
suant o RCW 35.13.280 and for the pexriod specified therein.
Pursuant to Ordinance ilo, 2219, such franchise or permit or

any right to operate thereunder expires absolutely five years
after the effective date of such annexation or consclidation.
The pregxisting franchise wvight now held by Eastside Disposal
Company to operate in the are of old loughton, therefore, will




expire July 31, 1973.)

Seetion %: The work embraced in these specifications shall be
under thae supervision of the City Manager or his authorized
reprecentative.,

Seation 5: Permission will not be given for the withdrawal ox
modifieation of any bid or propogal after submission theraesof.

Seoetion 6: Bids will not be considered if detached from the
specifications with which they are bound, nor shall any of
the accompanying papers be detached therefrom, but the entire
bid package shall be unbroken, in good condition and enclosed
in & sealed envelope with the name and address of the bidder
thereon, and a statement that this envelope contains a bid
for refuse eolliection.

Scotion 7: Bidders are notified to examine thowoughly these
instructions, the proposal, and gpecifications.

Seetion 8: The best cstimate of the City as teo the approzimate
punbor of cugtomers at the present time within the entire City
of Kiskland (including those arcas not previously served by

the City's contract collsctor) is:

Single Family wrcsidenca 3750

Multi-family residence with cans 90

Muitl-family residence with con-
tainers of 2 yard capscity or less 580

Comnesraial with cans 150
Comnercial with contalnexrs of

2 yard capacity or less 70
Commercial with containers with
capacity in excess of 2 yards 25

Seation 9: Maximum Acceptable bid, No bid proposal will be
accepted oy contidered where any item oy aliernate proposal
therein on & non-mandatory basis execedz the rats for & comparable
item or service eotablished by Tariff 1% of the holder of Public
Utility Commission Carbage Franchisc G-70 (Lastside Disposal
Company), which franchise covers the geographical area within
which the City of Kirkland is situated.

Seetion 10: Pro-Bid Conferencs - Mandatoxy Attendance.

No bid proposal will be accaptcd rrom any person or rirm who
has not attended the pre-bid conferance to be held by the City
of Kirkland not less than 10 days prier ¢to the date set for the
opening of bids. Attendance at sald conference is mandatory.




Section 11l: Alternates. Speeial attention is directed to
Alternate o, YIX in the proposal. Alternate II1 proposes

to provide complete collection and digposal serviece for single
family residences. The use. of an annual flat rate for total
collestion is designed in part to permit the successful bidder
to experiment with recent innovation in solid waste management
and to gain the benefit of sueh savings as may result therefrom.

Seetion 12: Commencoment of work., The existing contract

under which garbage 18 collecied within the City of Kirkland
expires June 30, 1973. Therefors, the sucesssful bidder shall
be prequired to commence work under the new contract as of July 1,
1973,




SPECIAL SPECIFICATIOHS FOR
GARBAGE AND REFUSE COLLECTION
CITY OF XIRKLAND

1. Ceneral Description:

The work to be performad consicte of the complete ecollection
of all garbage, refuse and eertain other wastes accumulated in
the City of Kirkland, and disposal thewreof.

Handatory garbage service eollection and disposal has been
goquired within the old City of Kivkland for many years. Optional
o¥ non-nandatory service has prevailed within the eld Houghton
area. The decision as to mandatory or non-mandatory service is
rescrved by the City. Therefore, each item and each alternative
within the bid proposal shall be submitted uvpon both & mandatory
and o pon-mandatory basis,

Speelal attention is dirnected toward alternate Heo. IXI:
Unauthorized dumping of »efuse, garbage and li¢ter constitutes
environmental and safety hazard, and is detrimental to the wel-
fare, health and publie safsety. Therefore, complcte gavrbage
rafuse and litter collastion and disposal servica is a desired
objective. Alternate III proposes to provide such complete
colleetion and disposal servies for single-family residences.
The use of an apnual flat rate for total colleetion is designed
in part to permit the successful bidder to exuperiment with
recent innovation in solid waste management and to gain the
benefit of such savings as may xesult thersfrom.

2. Colloetion Schodula: No collsctions ghall be made exeept
within the following time schedule:

For comaercial and industrial: Between the hours of
6:00 AM and §:00 PM Honday through Satuwday (Where
spseial circumstances exist, expanded hours may be
authorized by the city upen request submitted by the
contractor and industrial or commercial customer.)

For residential dwellings: Between the hours of
7:00 A1 and 5:00 PM Monday through Saturday

For mixzed commercial and residential usage of same building:
Between hours of 7:00 AM and 5:00 PN Momday through Satuwrday.

3. Meaning of Torme:

The msaning of teyms and words herein shall be as defined
in Oxdinance 2038,




%, Employces ©o be Courtects, @tg.:

The Contractor shall require all employees to be courteous
at all times and not o vca loud or profane language and te do
their work as quietly as possibla.

5. Emplovyecs to Use Walks:

Empleyecs, in cellscting garbage, refuse and certain other
wasto, shall follow the regular walks for pedestrians while on
private property, xeturning to the street or alley after veplasing
the empty cans., They shall alss replace all garbage eans and
covars and close all gates opened by them., All employees shall
vear eclean uniforms .

6., Employces Not to Tregpasgs:

Empleyees shall not trespass or loiter, crosg property <o
adjoining preomises, or meddlce with property which doez not
conearn them,

7 L@a@ings

Extra care shall be taken in the lcading and trangportation
of gavbage, refuse and other waste so that none of the material
o ba ecollected is left, either on private property or om the
streats or alleys. Any garbags, refuse or other waste left on
private property or on streets or alleys by the Contracter shall
be slecaned up upon notice from the City Manager.

The Contractor shall be responsible for the sleaning of all
dobris spilled or tracked on any streset, allsy opr public plasce
by any of his equipment, and if the Contrastor feils to elean the
game within two hours after notice is scrved by the City Manager,
the City Manager may sause such gtreets ©o be cleanad and chavrge
the ceots to the Contractor.

8, IEmargoney Collectiona:

Adoguatce provision shall be made by the Contractor to provide
speeial sollections when garbage, refuse and other waste has net
been colleected during the regularly schedulesd trip. Speecial pick-
upe for missed collections shall bo made by the Contrastor whan
ordered by the City llanager at no cost to the City or the oceupant.
If the Contractor fails to provids a special pickup within 2% hours
of notification by the City lManager, the City lManager may causae
the work to ba doma. The sum of $5.00 for cach sueh piekup shall
ba billed ¢o the Contractor. For the purposes of this paragraph,
"missed colleection® shall not include collegctions not made fLor
reasons beyond the control of the Contracter, such as "Act of God",
acecess blocked by street construction or temporary road surface
condition due to unusual or ineclement weather, ste.




9. Collection Louipment:

In colleecting garbage, refuse and other waste under this
contract, the Contractor ahall wvse a&ll metal, watertight, com-
pletoly enclosed bodies that avc designed end manufactured for
<he collection of garbage and refupe and are capabls of ser-
vieing detachable contalners.

The number and type collsation vehicles furnished by the
Contractor shall be sufficiont for the colleection of all garbage,
rofuse and other waste. If there be any doubt by the Contractor
whether his proposed equipment is satisfactory or not, ha should
secure prior written approval from the City Managsr.

The Comtractor shall previde equipment capable of rewoving
garbage, refuse and other waste from industrial plants in such a
PAnNReY A8 approved by sach coneernsd industrial plant and the City.
"Such manner" may include use of rental equipment rather than pur-
chase of equipment, or collectien by subcontractor when approved
by the City.

10, Method of Dicpesal:

The Contractor shall deliver at his «ost 8ll garbage,
vafusce or other waste to & transfer station or sanitary land-
£311 operated by King County, the City of Scattle, eor their
Buecessoxrs, or such other site as shall be approved or meet
the solid waste disposal site requirvements of the Depavtment
of Ecology. The cuccessful bidder sghall, before ontaring
into eontract with the City, furnish wxitten evidenece that
it has approval to utilize any or all of the aforementioned
dicposal sites for the duration of the sontrast.

1l. Ownership of Equipment:

AL} vehicles, facilities, equipment and preperty used in the
performanee of this contract shall be wholly cwned by the Con-
ractor; provided, leasing or rental agrecments wmay be allowed
where approved by the City of Kirkland prior to gubnission of
bids and conditional sale contrast, mortgages or other eontrac-
tual arrangements for financing the purehase of such aquipmant
may be allowed where approvad by the Clty of Kirkland peior %o
execution of this eontrast. All such leasing or rental agree-
pents shall provide that im the event of default of this contract,
or of such leasing or rental agreement, the City at {tc option
shall have the wight ¢to take possession of and operate vehicles
and equipment covered by such leasing or rental agreement for
the unexpired term of thic contract. Any such conditional sales
contract, mortgage or other contractual avrangements for finan-
cing purchase of such equipment shall provide that in event of
dofault of this contract or of such conditional sales eoniraet,




mortgage or other econtractual arrangemsnt, the »ight to ?he
posscssion and use of such vehicles, cquipment and facilities
may be taken by the City for the unexpired term of this centract.

A variation of this section will be allowed where industrial
plants or commercial firms have ownership of colleeting equipment.

A2, Painting of VYshicles and Equipment:

Colleation vochicles shall be painted and numbered consacu-
vcly from one upward and shall have the Contraster’s name and
aurbor of the vehicle painted in letters of a contrasting color,
at loant fewr (3) inches high, on each side of ecach vehicle, and
the number painted on the rear, lo advertising shall be peprmitted
other than the name of the Contractor. All vehieles shall be kept
in @ elean and sanitavy condition; and all eollection vehicles
shall be steam ecleaned or'pressure washed" inside and out, at
least once ecash waek. Repainting of ald veshicles shall be done
not less than every 2-1/2 years. A1l detachable containers
furnished under the contract chall be either painted or galvanized,
and shall display the Contractor’s name and number of the sontalner.
These containe®a shall be steam elsaned oy "pressure wached” when-
ever necessary in the judgment of the City Manager and always
before being placed for a new customer,

18, Paxking of Yohiscleaz:

The Centractor shall not use property in or adjacent to that
sonad as residence, nor adjacent to the various disposal sites
for the pavking, standing, washing, ecleaning or octoring of hie
vahicles ox squipnent without the approval of the City Managev,

Areas used by tha Contracter for the storing, parking or
ropair of vehieles ghall be kopt in & clecan and ovrderly condition.

3%, Ropert and Mapos

Tho Centractor shall furnish an annual zepoxrt at the end of
cach calendar year to the City Manager showing the number of loada
of garbage, wefuse end ether wasto hauled by him to the dicposal
site during the year, the approximatc number of cubic yards per
load, and the Rotal number of cubic yards of garbage, refuse and




othey waste hauled to the disposal site for each month.

The Contractor shall also outline, on maps furnished by
the City, his collection routes. The Contrastor shall give
not less than five (8) days’ notice to the City lanager of
any change in the boundary of any route of the day or time of
colleation.

16, Contractor's 0ffice:

The Contraetor shall be required to maintain an office
provided with telephones and such attendants as kay be nescssgary
to take cars of complaints, orders Lor speeial service or inastruc-
tions from the City Manager. This offiee shall be in operation
betueen the hours of 6:00 AM and 5:00 PM, Monday through Satuwrdays
The telephones provided in sueh office shall be on a talephone
onchange which ecan be called from anywhere within the City of
Kivkland witheut toll or other long distance charge. Two-way
communication between said office and the collection vehicles
shall be maintained at all times between the houvrs of 6:00 All
and 5:00 PM lMonday through Saturday. Such sommunication may
bo by tweo-way wadio "ecall boy" faeclilities, or other arrange-
monts satisfactory o the City Manager.

16, Speeial Agrocment:

The Contrastor agrees to remove and dispose ©f garbags,
refuoe from the firve stations, eity hall, library, municipal
garage, water shops, recreational hall and other city owned and
ocoupied buildings used only for governmental purposes and from
<he sity parks within the city limits of Kivkland without charge
to the City, provided that the same is placed in sans econveni-
ently located for collaction. Additiens, deletions ox shanges
in collestion cubject to change we direated by the City Manager.

17, Annexetion or Consolidation:

Attontion is called to RCW 35,13.280 wmegarding the ights
of franchice or permit holders for garbage collection and/or
dieposal within areas which may be amncxzed te or consolidated
with the City of Kirkland, Ordinance XNo. 2219 of the City of
Kirkland providss that such franchise permit or carry-over
vight shall expire absolutely on the expiration of five years
from the effective date of such annexation or consolidatiomn.
The former City of lloughton was congsolidated with the City
of Kirkland effective August 1, 1968. Therefers, the franshise
permit er carry-over right of Eastside Disposal to serve said
arvea will expire absolutasly July 31, 3873, and the successful
bidder shall be required to provide sevvice within the former
City of Houghten, together with all other areas annexed to the




City of Kirkland or the City of Houghton prior to the date of
consolidation and presently corved by Eastside Disposal Company
commencing with the first Monday following the absolute expir-
ation of the franchise or pormit right of Lastside Disposal
Company to operate in said areas, or to-wit, on or bafore
August 6, 1973. Thersafter, ag to subsequent annexations or
consolidations, the suceessful contractor shall be required
<o provide service within sald annexad or consolidated arsas
on the first Monday follewing the expiration of the five year
carry-over period. The City will furnish to said suceesssful
bidder a list, including & map, setting forth auch annexed
ATOA0

18, Pormit to Haul Own Gavbage or Refuse:

The City is considering adopting a private hauling permit
¢o be made evailable to those residents or establishments who,
bocause of gpecial eircumstances relating to locatien or nature
of gorbage or other refuse, desimre te haul and dispose of their
oun gavbage or refuse. If such a permit should be established,
the recomrmendation and comronts of the Contractor would be
sollcited and congidered by the City prior to the granting of
such privatc permit.

18, Oporating Permits:

The Contractor shall teke out and pay for any permi¢a
raquired by the City or any other governmental auvthowity which
®ay be required under this contrast. Further, tha Contrasctor
ghall be obligatad to protect all publie and private uwtilieles,
whether ogcupying street or publie or private property. If
such uweilicies are damaged by reason of the Contractor's oper-
ations undaer this contract, he shall vepair sy replasse same o,
£ailing €o do 80 promptly, the City Manager shall sauce repairs
or veplacement to be made and the cost of doing so shall be
billed te Contragter monthly.

20, Liability Incuranea:

The Contrastor shall provide and maintain in full foree and
cffoct during the entirs term of this contract, or any renewal
thereeof, of a policy of Contractor's publie iiability insuvanes,
. neming the City as an additional insured, providing for limits
of not less than Five Hundred Thousand (6500,000) Dollars for
8ll damages arising out of bodily imjuries to or death of ene
pergen, and subject to that ilmit for cach person, & total
iinit of mot less than One Milliiom ($1,000,000) Dollawrs for all
danagaes avising out of bodily injuries to or death of twe or
RoPe porsons in any one accident; and zegular Contractor’s




property damage liability Iinsurance providing for a limit of
not less than Five Hundred Thousand ($§500,000) Dollars for all
damages arising out of injury to or destruction of property
during tho poliey periocd.

Sueh policy chall provide for ten (10} days' notice to
the City of any change, cancellation or lapse ef cuch poliesy.

The Contractor shall further indemnify and save the
City harmless from and against any and &ll loss, damage,
actions, claims, suits, judgmonts and liability in conmnaction
with logs of life, personal injury and/or damage to property
arising from or out of any cccurrenes, conduct or operation
of or by Contractor, Contractor shall alse pay all costs,
oxpenses and reagonable attorney’s feos that may be incusred
oy paid by the City in enforeing any and all terms ard coven-
anto of this centrast.

21, Povformanca Bond:

Baforo the contracte between the suscessful bidder and
the €ity shall be valid or binding against the City of Kirkland,
the Contractor shall furnish unte the City a proper performance
bond to be approved by the City Attorney, eonditionad that the
Contractor shall faithfully perform all the provisiens and
torme of the contract and relsated documents and pay all lgborers,
machanics and sub-contractors and magterialmen, and all perasons
whe chall supply such Contrasctor with provisions and supplies
for the earvying on of such woerk; which bond shall be signed
by the surety company as surety, and shall be in the amount
of Ona Hundwrad Thousand ($100,000) Dollavrs, which bend shall
at all times be kept in full fowee and effect.

22, Contractor te Make Examination:

The Contractor schall make his oun examination, investiga-
tieon and woveareh regarding the proper methed of deing the work,
and all conditions affezcting the work to be dens, and the labor,
equipment and materials nceded thereon, and the quantity of the
vork te be performed., The Contractor agrees that he has satis-~
£icd himself by his own investigation and vresearch regavding all
of such conditions, and that his conclusion to enter Ento the
proposed contract ie based upon such investigation and ressarch,
and that he shall make no claim against the City because of any
of the sstimates, statements or interpretatiocns made by ony
officar or agent of the City which may prove ¢o be in any res-
PRt arrondous .

The Comtractor assumss the risk of all eonditionsg foresean
or unforesean and agrees o continue the work without additional




compensation under vhagtever eivevrstances which may develop
other than as herein providaed.

23, Workman:

All vorkmen cmployed shall be competent and skilled in
the porformance of the work to which they may be assigned.
Fallure or delay in the performance of this centract due %o
the Contractor’s inability to obtain wovrkmen of the number
and 8kill requiraed shall constitute & default of the contract.

Whenover the Contractor is not prssent on the work,
ovders may de given by the City Hanagsr to the superintendant
or foxeman, who may have immediate chavge theraof. If any
person employed on the werk shall xefuse or neglect to obey
the direetion of the City Manager or in the opinion of said
City Manager shall be incompetent, unfaithful, diserderly,
opr otherwise unsatisfactory, he shall, upoen the order of the
City Manager, be at ones dischawrged.

2%, Company Heme:

The Contractor shall not voe a firm neme containing the
words "Kiskland®™, "City", or any words implying municipal
ewnership,

25, Liguidated Domages:

Ao @ broach of the servics provided by this contraect
would ecause gerious and substantial damage to the City and
ite occupants, and the nature of this eontrast would render
it impracticable or extremely difficult to £ix the actual
damage sustained by the City by such breach, it is agreed that
in case of breach of service the City may eleect to colleet
liquidated damages for each sueh breach and the Contragtor
will pay ¢o the City as liquidated darage and not a8 a penaliy,
the amounts set forth below, sueh sume being agreed as the
amount which the City will be damaged by the byeash of such
corvice. An cleetion to seck such vemsdies shall not boc gon-
gtrved as a waiver of any legal remedies the City may have as
to any subseguent breach of service under this contract.

A truck beginning vecidential eellection §10.00 per day
prior to 7:00 AM

10




Falluve to collect misses within twenty~ § 5.00 sach not
four (24) hours of notification to to exeeed 10
sentractor aomplainte per

truok per day.

Ropotition of conplaints on a soute afeer § 2.00 cach -

notivdication te roplaes cans or datach- not to encsed
able container in dooignated losations, 10 complaines
gpillling, not sloping gato, oroooing por truck por
planted awrqas, or oimilar violavions. day.

Such liguidated danagen as the City shall eleet te sollest
wild bo Billod ¢o the Contraster wonthly.

26, H@lﬂd@goe

Contracter ohall dosignato shieh holidayo he will cbserve
and indiente tho ochedulc he will werk if ¢the holiday £3lis on
a ragular eellestion day.

27, Tho City wosarves the »ight to eonstruct any lmprovoment

or ¢o permit cny cuch construction im amy ctract or alley in

puch nannor a8 the City Couneil may dircet, which may havo the
affact for a time of preventing the contractor from Iraveling

hio aceuvctomed woute or woutes for collestien. He shall, hewevar,
by the moest cupediecnt manner, continue ¢o colleet garbags o
rafuse ¢o the game ewtent as though no interferenec existed

upon the 8treoty o alloys normally traversed. This chall bs
done av no extra eupense to the City of Kirkland,

28, Ropertg. ALl poperts soquived ¢o be submitted to the
City by ¢ contractor shall be on forms approved by the City
and ghald ba typed or legibly printed. Sueh weports chall
inedudo collesction routen, regidontial pickup schedules, none
ragddential pickup schedulog, insluding nvmbers of cans ov
gontoiners, and number of pickups per weck a8 €0 cach non-
singlo family wmagidential sustomer,

1




Ciiy of BEdniland

ATDSIITAIY T o
RN NS AR 2

FIENS g Lnvitation To band
o and FBefuse Collection

! &Y

bkl

(3
Sl »

&mﬂmdmﬁnﬁ wo Pavsoranh 2) Speclel Spealfications, Collection

Zehadn

Lo

within the following Cime pohedule:

2, Collsction Schadule: No cclleetiong shall be nmada excaept

For comamdroeial “';:jrd indusiriel: Betwean the hours of
B:00 AM and 580 PM :%mdm througsh Saturday. Saturday
servine i .Jz.»;gn:z*«;w and mey be waguliwed um Qe AQCRMKY
latione @f gurhams o rm{,,m beoomny R Sani .am.@:\'s o
Liener problos, e epecial clrounstannes ewiat,

(.-.u\‘hfi yimad by the ol *:y R GRE
¥

expandad houre mey

o .y e ‘A P o - - T
reguast sabltiad E,nyv he contrantor and induetrial
o Qummarelal oustone.

Pow reeldential at’.vaw'%, A.g nEsr  Setween The houwss of

¥ Jeﬂ ,m'i and %00 ¥ Vondey Throvgh S ..\,nrlm,

Fon mined @«mwpsxmﬂgﬁ.ﬁ., and w

L
Bobwesn houre of 700 A and §:00 PM Monday

midentlicl veage of sane build.lmg'

cb
iy
3
=
GEE*
5
[>4
3
2
a7
*



Y

.
City of Kirkland

ADDENDUM I to Special Spocd icaaxansp Insiruetions te Bidders
and Proposal for Garbage end Revuse Collsoiics

Arnended Ppopomal:

The undersigned héraby certifies as follows: . L

That BAYSIDE DISPOSAL CO.

have personally and ¢arartliy examined the spacf?ications,"?brm‘
of contqact and thg foragoing insteuwctions for the work to be. | -
dane in aollmotlon and dizpogal of garvbage, rafuse eand other VW
waste in the City of Kizkland. _ A,

. BAYSIDE -DISPOSAL CO. S e
have examred Tha podate oL olglin and will dispose of all coll@c»

tions to a tranasfer station or sanitary landfill opevated by King
County, the City of Seatile, or their successors, or such other K -
asite as ghall be approved or meet the solid waste dispesal aita
requirements OL the Daparimant of Ecology. :

That having wmads the necessary examination the undersigned
hereby propeoses e furnich all materials, vehiclea, plant, equip~
mant and fa¢ilities, and to perform all Jabor and services which
may be vrsquired to do said werk within the time fixed and upon
the terms and conditions provided in the said apecifications,

ecntract and the forsgoing instructions at the following prica, = wa”f

To-teit:

A five year conitract for the colleetion and dispcsal of -
garbage and refuse Iin the thy of Kirkland (lese those terrltorlea
coverad by s@parate f“anuﬁlab or permita pursuant to RCW 35,13, 280
and for the peraoca apec L. fied thereln, and those customers that
zmay hereafter obiain’d valld permit from the City of Klrkland to

 haul their own garbapge ovr rofuse because of special circumstances). '

Providsd, houwever, that the amsunts dbid within Alternative (II-1
ﬂaoxdenuialn may be subjeet to review and modification at the end
of the thixrd year, :

Special Definitlens:

"Curbside™ means the adge of the street or alley wherézﬂiﬁ
garbege and raruse placed for plokup, whether opr not there is
agtually & eurb inamalled . "

"Evarything Placed for Pickup By Rasident” as uaed 1n T

 AlternatIvs YT1-I iz Bubjeot €6 the Limitations imposed by
- Ordinance 2038 es to the volume, welght and size of the eang .




L.
[

or ordinance unit packagns in wbich the refuse o garbag@ HUST
be placed by the rmnadamz_fo; pickup. . fﬁ

Bid ?r@pnmwl Paperit Eocloged §.

ALTERNATE PROPOSAL b

Detail , o A. Mandatory B. Non- o
) Handatory ik

I -1, BResidential Single Femily: S e
1 pickup per wgek S . . DL
i @an not over 24 feet o S ' -
2 cans not ovar 25 faost’
‘ Each additionsal con wol .

ovar 726 femt

*

I - 2, Apartment Houseo trellier Court, ' B g et
, Apartment, -Hotal S | L U
(a) 2 sans psr nickup o o : S T
Each additicnal cun L ' o . .o A
~, per pickup o » o By
N {b) Container: SR L o
1 yoerd capaclty per pickup I - LNt

1-1/4% yd eupaei“v per pickup

1-3/2 yd capacity per plckup
110 o 20 ya caepacity per piciiup
20 to 40 wd eapam*ty per pﬁe}up

I - 2, Non residential zates: | : g S
(2) 2 eana per_pickup - i L | I T
b pane per piakup - ' .. : -
. Fach additicnal oen per pickup
) Containar'
1 veard sapacity per yard per
pickup
1-1/2 yd capaeity par yard psr
pickup
2 yd capseity peor yvaxrd per pickup - e
3 to 8. .yd capavity por yard per Lk jf;

pickup {
10 to 40 yd¢ ceprecity per yard
7 per plakup - (Plus '{Plus
' ' actual dump - actu“I’dﬁmp
fea) - fae)

1 : M
" r"l RN
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Qﬁiﬁié I 4. Mandatopy B, Nown-
| - | | ' | Fatdatory
ALTERNATIVE X g

LI ~ 1(a} Residential Single Family'
Hoekly 5.ck\ap
‘ 1 can -~ curhelde
| 2 cang - curkside
Each can oven ¢ - eurbaide

or
II ~ 1{b) Residentiel Single ¥Family O TP R A T OO
1 pickup per weoek s ~ : T L P
1 cen ~ curbside to 25 £t , o
2 cang - cwrbsida to 25 Tt , SN RS
‘ . Each aan ever 2 - curbslds %o 25 £t - R

IT - 1{e) Residential Siﬂgle tkwmly
pickup per week , C e CE s T
gen - O0-te 2% £ - 0 " R T
can - 25 £% te B0 £2 o A
caw -~ over 58 £t ‘ i
gang - O to &5 £ ' ‘ ST
cang -~ 2% £t o €0 f¢ - ' o T
cang - cvey 68 £© : o o o
Each can in excess of ' ' S
§ teo 25
Each can in eucess of
25 to 68 ft
Each can in cucess of 2: : L
over 68 £t ' : ‘ S . ' : B

PO R R B8 (e fud bt

ITI - 2 Apavrtment hovsfp Traller Court -
: Apartment, Hotel - . : e R
(a) 2 consg’ per pickup : T SRR SR Ly
¥ach addivional can o . TR
per pickup
(b} Containar:
1 yard gapacity par pickup L : I
1-1/% yad capacity par pickup Tk
1-3/2 yd wopaclty per plckup ; Fp P
.40 ¥o 20 yd aapacity pex pickup - o N
20 2o 40 wd capacity per pickup : R




- . "Dataii - o, gl T AL Mandatoxy

"o g

: Ba Non"’ '1 .' ‘ :

I - 3§ Kon-rssidential votes:
- {a) 2 cang per plokup

€T me.

fandatery .

i

& gang pew pdcﬂmp

Eoch additional wan per plekup -

” ‘ {b} Container:
L 1 yard capacity per yﬁrﬂ per
pickup

1-31/2 yd eapaaity per vard per
picky

2 yd c&paa?ty per yard per
piclkup

3 to 8 yd capeacity per vard par

. pickup
10 to 40 yd capeailty per yard . 1
per pickup’ . {Plus

””(?iﬁm‘

L ; .- antmal dump
“" S . - fes)

| ALTERNATIVE IXX < COMPLETE COLLECTION AND DISPOSAL OF ALL j
. REFUSE, GARBAGE LITTER - TOTAL SERVICE .

II7 - 1(a) Residential 8ingle amily . ﬁf.

1 pickup per week, everything placed

% for pickup by resident - Annual flag

g C rate sum per single Family vegidence
T ' - Curbsida: $25.68
0 to 20 £+ : 25,68

25 to 80 £t | 7888

TII - 1{b) Reaidential Single Frmily
‘ srmual flat rate suz, 1 can pey week

Cuxrbgide v ‘ 22,80
0 to 25 ft L _ 27,80
25 to 60 fi ’ CoY B 510
Annual flatg rﬁts bumg 2 cane pep waek
Curbside ‘ 24,60
¢ to 25 £ . 24,60
25 to 60 (¢ 25.80
Everything p;aeed for pxcknp by residEnt
Curbside 25.68
0 to 25 £ | | : . 3588
25 teo 60 f<¢ ' ' 26,88

TIX - 2 Apartmsnt Housze, Tmailes Court,
e Apertmont, Hotel , : : B
7. - (a) 2 cans per pieckup /week $3,.50/month"

' écvuml ﬁump

fea)

Each additionel can per pickup .40

(b} Containar: , 3
1 yard capacity pev plekup 2,20
1-1/% y4 capa ulty ger plckwp . = _2.40
1~1/2 yd eapacity per pickup 2.70

10 to 26 yd c@p@city per pickuyyd 1.60
20 to 40 vd capacity per pickuwyd 1.50

Y




Detail

Lo Nanﬂatnﬁg

"B, Nom- = . g

Mandafery .~ i
LI¥ - 3  HNon-Regidential rates : St PR L o ey
‘ - {a) ¢ cans per pickup /week: $3.50/month_  _84.00/mapth . e
% cang per plokup /week 6. 75/month 7.25/month ¢ ¥
: Each additlional ¢an per pickup ., L0 ‘ 50 e
(b} Containex: , S
1 yard eapag&b;gxxxanxkpev . co T
pickup 2,20 2,80
1-3/2 yd eapacity WM per ‘ o
. pickup 2.70 3,00 "
2 yé capacity perxypend par S
pickup 3.75 4,05
-3 to 8 yd capacity per yard i
per pickup’ 1.60 1,60 __f_ :
10 o 40 yd . c&paetx} pex yard ‘ e e
. © pey pick up 1.00 (Plus 1. 00 (Plus
actval dump aactua ump
v fea) fee}

"

1

Residential customers shall ﬁrovid&'at'theiv own éxpmnseﬁ

garbaga cans or other guiteble containers meeting the requirements - . 1

N . of Kirklarnd Ordinance No. 2038,

Mult;pl@ famlly residential cug- =~ -
tomers opr non-residential commercial or industrial cuctomers shall ok
provide at their own expense garbage cans or other sultable con~ - .10 .

tainsrs meeting the requiremznts of Ordinance No. 2038, either as

to garbage cans, ordinance units or detachable containers, ‘ .
detachable contalners are ysed, they ehall be of such design as . @5
In this .~ o 7.

can be servicad by Contractor's collection equipment.
connection the Coniractor may enter into an agreement with the T
customey to furnish such container or containers or garbage can . . . 7

or cans as the dxspcsal naada of the custoser may requira.
agreement shall be éntirzliy betvesn the_ eontractor and the cue- . .
temer, &#nd any ¢ost oy chargs mads therefor by the contractor
ghalli be billed a&nd collected by thae contractor,
however, shall prevant tho customsr from entering lnto such an-
arrangement with any pevrzoen or firm othexr than tha Contractor, . . e
nozr prevent the Confractor from entering into such an avrange-;“ﬁ'l“ :

ment with the customse without ¢harge o the cusiomer.

garbage oans, detachable eontainers or ordinance unit bags or
requiransnts of Ondznanqa 2038, '

and any applicable wrales or rvegulations of the King County -

Health Dapavtment snd the Dapariment of Ecology. : ‘

wrappers must conform To the

Nothing hereiﬁ,qﬂ J

ihera

Sueh 4

All




, For purposes of ‘information and comparison only, |bidder ' '
hag atiached to thie proprsal a copy of its ourvent zontainer .
vantas scheduls. . ; ; ‘ 3

It is understoosd that the City of Kirkland operates ite - .
own garbage utility and that in that capacity ic contracting :
with the contyadtor to provide sellection and disposal serviecs .
only, and that the bid proposal herein contained is for the ’

consideration o be paid to the Contractor for p@rforming.auehrf“ahj“"f

gervice and is no% the rate or charga to be made to the indi- ' ..
vidual regidential or non-residentlsl customer, and there i .
not necessarily any comparisen or velatioaship betwesn the rate: . .
or method of calculoting compensation %o be paid to the garbage.: -
collector and the rate charged by the city garbage willity to
the individual cuwstomer for the furnishing of such serwice. .

-

CONTRACTOR e BAYSIDE DISPOSAL CQ, Rl LI
ADDRESS ' 2437 6th Ave. South . - b ot

Circle. gorreat form of antity: Sole proprietorship

. C%@gﬁnqwahip
: QPpmvaticﬁ;‘

gl

Signature s/
; Bruce Leven, President ..
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R - REAUGH HA.RT ALLISON PRESCOTT & DAVIS

DAN REAUGH
' GEORGEH.HARY * :. . - e
ROBERT B. ALLISON . , L T
LOREN D. PRESCOTT ; #oh R
JACK R. DAVIS - T C
KEITH R. BALOWIN iy = : R
BIFFORD S.CRANE - - ' . w W g

1100 IBM BUILDING
s .. SEATTLE, WA. 98101 -
& U TELEPHONE '823-6400 '

, ‘ Wil AREA CODE 208
HUGH H. BENTON.JR., . ER T oo o A
of Counsal : o ' ;

- Mr. Allen Locke ,',‘wfift””
-+ City Manager o
+iiCity of Kirkland -

Klrkland Washington

KR YTITY TTTIT

s T ' '4}ffr’}‘»‘cwv Gﬁdﬂﬁﬁkawg
_‘Ret Bayside Dlsposal Company e e LA -
- . B1d PrOposal T S ;:1‘r1£”‘

|

',,fn Dear Mr. Locke°,3A‘ f:fﬁﬂ"

Upon careful review of the bid proposal that was . accepted‘
by the Kirkland City Council by unanimous vote. Tuesday ;-
" June 5, 1973, it has been discovered that a clerical errorj.
was made in typing up the bid pr0posal in respect to

\ Alternate III part 2 and part 3. N | -

‘The bid proposal as submitted under Alternate IIIﬁ- 2a{, A
provides a rate of $3.50 per month under manatory collection ‘
-~ two cans per pickup per week and $.40 for each additional .,
.., -'can per pcikup. This should be corrected to $2:05 per . '
‘month for two cans per pickup per week, each. addltlonalq
‘can per pickup'f 40 ' SR
Under Alternate I1I - 3, mandatory plckup non-residentia1“='
; 18 shown:as $3.50 per month for -two cang per. week pickup
$6 75 per month for four cans ' per ‘week pickup, ahdJeachfw
addltional can per pickup $.40. This should be- .corrected 5
.to read two cans per pickup per week at $2. 75, each. additional”
" can per pickup $.40 with the $6.75 per month four cans perc
pickup per week elimlnated in its entlrety. !

T

-

~T apologize for not having corrected these typographi

‘errors earlier and if there is any question, please give me
'*ia call i S it o

“Jack Ri Davis—




i IDESECOS AL,

2437 SIXTH AVENUE SOUTH
SEATTLE, WASHINGTON 98134
(206) MU 2-0475

EBATSHID

June 26, 1973

Mr. Allen Locke

City Manager

City of Xirkland
Kirkland, Washington

Re: Bavside Disvnosal Company
Bid Proposal

Dear Mr. Locke:

1t has been brought to my attention that my letter of

June 8, 1973, is incomplete and inconsistent in respect

to the proper amounts to be charged under Alternate III-2a
and Alternate III-3.

The proper rates under the bid proposal for Alternate
ITI-2a should re=ad as follows:

2 cans per pnickuo per week, mandatory
pickup - $2.05 per month;

4 cans per pickup per week, mandatory
pickup - 32.85 per month:

Each additional can per pickup - $.40
Alternate III-3 mandatory pickup non-residential should
read as follows:

2 cans per pickun per week - $2.05 per month;

Each additional can per pickup - $.40

I trust that this will properly clarify and complete the
information submitted in my earlier letter.

-““Very truly yours;

Y N\

~., . ;
“'\
’ i L2

Jack R. Davis

JRD:1m
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